
GOVERNMENT OF ANDHRA PRADESH 
SCHOOL EDUCATION (PS) DEPARTMENT 

Memo. No.ESE0l/113/2022-PS-1 Dated: 16/12/2022 

Sub: SE - An Ordinance further to amend the Andhra Pradesh Education 
Act, 1982 to raise the age of superannuation of the teaching and 
non-teaching employees of the aided private educational institutions 
with retrospective effect ie, from 01.01.2022 - Promulgated - Reg. 

Ref: 1. From the CSE, AP, Lr.No. ESE02-17 /39/2022-PS 1-CSE, 
dated: 09.04.2022. 

2. From the Higher Education Department, e-file No: EHE0 1-
CCE0MISC/77 /2022-CE (Computer No: 1677868), dated : 
24.08.2022 . 

3. Andhra Pradesh Ordinance No.13 of 2022, 
dt.29.11.2022,published in Part IV-B, Extraordinary of the 
Andhra Pradesh Gazette, dated 29th November, 2022. 

---xxx---

The Commissioner of School Education, the Commissioner of 
Intermediate Education and the Commissioner of Collegiate Education are 
informed that, an Ordinance No.13 of 2022 dated 29.11. 20222 further to 
amend the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982 to raise the age of 
superannuation of the teaching and non- teaching employees of the aided 
private educational institutions with retrospective effect i.e, from 
01.01.2022, has been promulgated, which has been published in Part IV-B, 
Extraordinary of the Andhra Pradesh Gazette, dated 29th November, 2022 
(A.P. Ordinance No.13 of 2022) . A copy of the same is sent here with. 

2. They are therefore, requested to take further necessary action 
accordingly, in the matter. 

PRAVEEN PRAKASH 
PRINCIPAL SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT 

To 
The Commissioner of School Education, A. P, Ibrahimpatnam, NTR 
District(we) 
The Commissioner of Intermediate Education, A.P, Tadepalli, Guntur 
District(we) 
The Commissioner of Collegiate Education, Vijayawada (we) 
Copy to: 
The Higher Education Department, A. P.Secretariat. 



The GA (Cabinet) Department (w.r.t U.O.No.313/2022, dt.08.11.2022) 
The Law Department. 
The OSD to Minister for Education. 
The PS to Spl. Chief Secretary to C.M. 
The PS to Principal Secretary to Government. 
S~Sc ~ 

//FORWARDED: :BY ORDER// ~ "-' ,,,,u-.kv,,:. 
SECTION OFFICER 



6743407/2022/PS- SE 

&So~~ai ~~~L~~ 
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE 

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

RIGHT TO 
INFORMATION 

13] AMARAVATI, TUESDAY, 29th NOVEMBER, 2022. 

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND 

REGULATIONS Etc. , 

The fo llowing is the author itative text in English Language of the Ordinance 

promulgated by the Governor on the 27th November, 2022 is being published under Article 

348(3) of the Constitution oflndia fo r general information:-

ANDHRA PRADESH ORDINANCE No. 13 OF 2022 

Promulgated by the Governor in the Seventy-third year of the Republic oflndia. 

AN ORDINANCE FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA 
PRADESH EDUCATION ACT, 1982. 

Whereas, section 78-A of the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, I 982 governs the age of 

superannuation of the teaching and non-teaching employees of the a ided private educational 

institutions; 

And whereas, the age of superannuation of Government servants has been raised from 

sixty years to sixty two years under the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age 

of Superannuation) Act, 1984 through the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of 

Age ofSuperannuation)(Amendment) Act, 2022 (Act No.4 of2022) with effect from O 1.01.2022; 

And whereas, consequent on the raising ofthe age of superannuation of the Government 

servants, it has been decided to ra ise the age of superannuation of the teaching and non-teaching 

employees of the aided private education institutions by amending the provision of the section 

78-A of the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982 su itably with retrospective effect i.e fro m 

01.01.2022; 

J.No.51 /41 (11 

295 



6743407/2022/PS- SE 

2 ANDI-IRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY fPART- IV-B 

And whereas, it is also decided to re-induct such teaching and non-teaching employees, 

who retired fro m service with effect on and from I" January, 2022 to the date of the publication 

of the Andhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022; 

And Whereas, the Legislature of the State is not now in session and the Governor of 

Andhra Pradesh is satisfied that circumstances exist wh ich render it necessary for him to take 

immediate action; 

Now, therefore, in exerc ise of the powers conferred by clause (I) of article 213 of the 

Constitution oflndia, the Governor hereby promulgates the fo llowing Ordinance:-

Short tit le and l. ( I) This Ordinance may be called the Andhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Ordinance, 
commencement. 

2022. 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect on and from the 1st January, 2022. 

Amendment of 2. (n the Andhra Pradesh Education Act, 1982, in Section 78-A,-
section 78-A. 

Act No. 1 of 1982. (i) In sub-section ( I), in the opening paragraph, for the words "sixty years", the words "sixty 

two years" shall be substituted. 

( ii) Under sub-section ( I), for the first proviso and second proviso, the fo llowing shall be 

substituted, namely,-

"Provided that every teacher or member of the non-teaching staff employed in any 

aided private educational institution, who retired from service on attaining the age of sixty 

years on and from I st January, 2022 to the date of publication of the Andhra Pradesh 

Education (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022, shall be re-inducted into the service/post as 

such with effect from the date of publication of the said Ordinance: 

Provided fi11ther that the said interregnum period from the I" January, 2022 to the 

date of the publication oftheAndhra Pradesh Education (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 

shall be treated in such manner as may be prescribed.". 

(iiO In sub-section (2), for the words "sixty years", the words "sixty two years" shall be 

substituted. 

(iv) In the explanation thereunder, fo r the words "sixty years", the words "sixty two years" 

shall be substituted. 

BISWABHUSAN HARICHANDAN, 
Governor of Andhra Pradesh. 

G. SATYA PRABHAKARA RAO, 
Secretary to Government, 

Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice. 
Law Department. 

296 



6743407/2022/PS- SE 

131 

~o~~a-E oc~~l?~ 
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE 

PART -IV-B EXTRAORDINARY 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

AMARAVATI, TUESDAY, 29'h NOVEMBER, 2022. 

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND 

REGULATIONS Etc., 

~OLQ~of t:S~~w, e9~bot~w ~e~ 

:)~o'.S.J~~OJ 3>.)~o/i',:,~:). 

2022, ~~oeJ6..), 27~ ~6~ K~~6..) w5 i3fv~ ~ ~oe @Q"sa.:a~ 

'do~~ zy>~6~ @~5""6 ~6~;5.) zy6e§ ;6o~Q"~~ &ills& 348 (3) @;5.}i3.)6~ 

l_§oe @oc.S5 o:J6..)s ~~1~ Ljti)5oweJ<i)'ii)~J_e. 

2022e54~ 13~ ~otQL~of @9~bot~ 
zy6e§ ~WO"~s~ om ~6~ ;6o~e§J6~6 K~6J_6..)i3 we i3o:i)eJo~e. 

YOLO~oi .:>c:rb t:S~~. 1982~ so~;6.J- ;S;Seo~l:>!;S @!~bot~. 

~ol¢~ai ~CT'S w~~. 1982 &ms& 78-;.; j5at)cs~, o:>cmo5 ~3l.xl 

~CT'S .60~~6 6c,S~ .;S.:iedll) 6c,S;$66 tl,-o"sfu~ jCS!l ~6.;S.:ito> ~o:i);6.)J 

fu 5 0 W eJ ~ o:i) zt~~~J_O c.$.)~ ;SJ,,; 

~.:i5oJ~ , 01-01-2022~ e:j6 ~.:iod @~,.)~.JC~~J. ~OL~G5a.f 

~~8,so"sfl"~ (jcs!l ~o.;S.:ito> ~o'.5.:i;6.)J ~.;').:)eJ~s6to>) (c0~6£a)) i:s~~. 2022 

(20226~ 4~ w~~) CT',SO" ~ol¢~ai ~~8,so"sfl"~ (jCS!) ~6.;S.:,to> ~o:i);$.:iJ 

~.;S.:ieJ~S6£a)) w~~. 1984 l_§oCS ~~6,s tl,-Q"Sfu~ jCS!) ~6.;S.:i£a) ~o'.5.:i;$.:iJ 

@6~ oo<i) .6o~~J6~~~ ~oweJo~oc.S.:>~;SJ,,; 

[3] 

RIGHT TO 
INFORMATION 

297 



6743407/2022/PS- SE 

4 ANDHR.A PRADESH GAZETrE EXTRAORDINARY [PART - IV-B 

i6olK;;'r,;!'~~ 

~eo:m pooz:5~-

78-~ ;6Bi5.,:io~;S§J 

i6~0E.>. 

~ 5 dll)' 0 e;5J e§,s t;;v Cs K:i V j cs b ~ 6 ~ Eo> .;S 0).) c0JJ ;6J ~ 0 w ;6 cs 5 c0J e.r' 

01-01-2022 ;6Jo& e§[\;6 ~o.s .;S~o~e)° @~O) @oils ~Q;;ix,cr ~ol¢0of 

~CT"St:S~;;ix,, 1982 cfu.)S& 78-~ jBi3r)CS~ ::}ZJoQ;6;5J ;6.;SBoiS.)l) CT",SO" oJQ)Jel5 

~je.xi ~CT"S i6o~v6 6Q;6 ~5dll) 6Q;566 evcsK:iv jCSb ~6~Eo> 
.;S o:5.)~J ;6J ~ o t:S .;Sa ;6::) ::) g (),)Jo t:S ~ ~ ;6 o 6-) ;6 ~; 

~5dll), 2022, ~;6.;SB 1.;S e6 ~5dll) @j.Jej ;6Jo& ~OL0Ljof ~CT"S 

(c6.;S6Eo>) @o-so-lf;;ix,, 2022 0t5.)6Eo> e6 .;So~ .66.5~ ;6Jo& jCSb ~6~Eo> 

oJ>oE>;6~ 6Q;6 ~5dll) 6Q;5~6 e:vci5sK:iv;5J 85f\ ~~§';6.;Sa;6::) ~~ 
::)QQ)JQt:$~3);606.);6~; 

ra ._ 

~5dll), O"~ ~;6;6~o~e) ~jj<'.i) ;6~j,a';;ix,6 e3;6o6.);6~ ~5dll) 

:.3ol):5 t:56£ ~;SJs6.;Sv~;6 j5~~Je.>J J6_y~;6~~ 1!'90L0Ljc3.f X~6j6J 
®2)L~o:5.)jc1;6o6.);6~; 

-q-6e§ c6o~o-;6;;ix,6::) 213.;S @;6Ji3r)CS~ ~o~;;ix, (1) CT",SO" 2..,c6KZJ&;6 

@l;:,s6~v;6J ~::)d3.?f\i5~, K.;S6J_O-) ~jj~, ~ocSv~volT" ~ l_§oe 

@o-s 01 ;;ix, ;6J we a dll) i5.) cv"J.;6.): -

1. (1) ~ @o-so-lf;;S_x,;6.) ~ol¢Ljo-f ~CT"s ('6.;SoEo>) ®o-sa-lf;;S_x,, 2022 ®::) 

""!) °& ;6 .;S iS.)tJ ;6J . 

(2) ~e 2022, ~;6.;SB 1.;S e6;6 ~5dll) @e.3 e6 ;6Jo& @~o:i6::)§ 
e.J 

.;Sw;:i;6~cr -qo~ot:SZJ~.;Sa;6J. 

2. ~ol¢Ljof ~CT"s t:S~;;ix,, 1982 6::) 78-~ jBar)CS;;ix,6,-

(i) e:vj-jBi3r)CS;;ix, (1) 6::) L~6oz;5 "°!)Q""[i"~6 "@6~ c6o.;Se§;i6;;ix,o:i" 

@;6J j CS ;;ix, V ~ ZJ 6-) o:> /T" "@0~ 0 0 6.) c0 0 .;S e§J O ;;ix, o:>" @;6J j CS ;;ix, V ;6.) 

e:vot:S.;Sa;6J. 

( ii) e:vj-jBi3;:iCS;;ix, (1) ~oCS~;6j_ 3).)C$ej ~cv"Q)JO~ ~5dll) oo~.;S 

~cv"Q)Jo~~ ZJc:i}o:irr- ~ l_§oe o)""e,3::) eot:S.;Sa;5J, @j.;S;6cr ,-

"@O).)eJ, 2022 ~;6.;SB 1.;S e6§ ~5dll) 1!'9oLQ0of ~CT"S (c6.;S6to>) 

®O"So-lf;;ix,, 2022 dms& 0i5.)6to> e6§ ~QS @6~ i6o.;S6;i6~v .;So:5.)~J 

::)oc1;6 b-:>CSl) .66,s~ ;6Jo& jCSb ~6~Eo> oJ>oE>;6 ~o::) oJ(),).)~5 ~je.xi ~CT"S 

298 



6743407/2022/PS- SE 

29th NOVEMBER 2Q??J ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 

;60~6 j~ao:5.x>~;Scl ~800-))S etoJ-Q"go:5.x>~ e:30" 6c;Sje16 ~<'{)ol) 00-))S& 

;64,g~ ;666:) @Q"gB<lf~ Lj~6rn ~6 ;6.)oo @~w6~§ .;S~..) ~Q~IT" 

;66,s~Jj6~6~§ 8ef\ 8~s';St>J~.;Sa;6.): 

@O~~~ow, siosrSJ- 2022, t'z;S.;Se 1.;S e16 ;6.)oai ~ol¢~~ ~CY'S (;6.;$66.>) 

@Q"gB<lf~, 2022 00-))S& Lj~66.> ~6§ ~c:;SgKe> ;666:) ~O"~ ~u-.;Sf::,~ 

~~e)j6i.:5t>J~;Se5 586 j5Xrnoi.:S.;Sa;6.).". 
eJ 

iii) e,-j-j5a.;)6~ (2) 6 "@6~ ;6o.;SeiJ6~w" @;6.) j6~e>~ 

t>Jci)wIT" "@6~ oo~ ;6o.;SeiJ6~w" @;6.) j6~e>;6.) eoi.:S.;Sa;6.). 

(iv) CY'~ t_506~;Scl ~<lf6s6rn6 "@6~ ;6o.;SeiJ6~w" @;6.) j6~e>~ 

t>Jci)wIT" "@6~ oo~ ;6o.;Se)J6~w" @;6.) j6~e>;6.) eoi.:S.;Sa;6.). 

i>t,s~~&'f ~0~oC:S.S 

~ot9~Bf X.;S6cl6)· 

23. r5t1'.b l;S~S-o'cr~, 

Lj4>e),s ~6g6eJ, 

oJ"SO).), ~;6;S .;Sg.;S~6~o:> ~eo:5.x> 

oJ" s 0,).) oJ' e.) ;S' oJ" s 0,).) ~gp. 

299 

5 



300 
6743407/2022/PS- SE 


