
GOVERNMENTOFANDHRAPRADESH 
ABSTRACT 

Public Services- Finance Department -Age of Superannuation of Government 
employees- Enhancement of age  of superannuation of Government employees 
from  60  years to  62 years as per   the   Andhra  Pradesh  Public Employment 
(Regulation of  Age  of  Superannuation)  (Amendment) Ordinance,  2022  w.e.f. 
01.01.2022 -Instructions-Issued. 

FINANCE (HR. IV-FR&LR) DEPARTMENT 
 
 
G.O.Ms.No.l5                                                                       Dated: 31.01.2022. 

Read  the following: - 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ORDER: 

Andhra  Pradesh   Public   Employment   (Regulation  of   Age   of 
Superannuation)  (Amendment) Ordinance,  2022  (A.P. Ordinance 
No. 1 of 2022) published in  the  Andhra Pradesh Gazette Part-N-B 
Extraordinary, No.1, Amaravati, dt.31.01.2022. 

*** 
 
 

In   the   Ordinance  published  in   reference read  above, an  Ordinance 
namely,  Andhra  Pradesh  Public  Employment  (Regulation of  Age  of 
Superannuation} (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 (A.P. Ordinance No. 1 of 2022) 
has been   issued.  According to  the aforementioned Ordinance, the   following 
amendments have been issued to  the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment 
(Regulation of Age of Superannuation} Act,  1984:- 

 
 

"1.  (i} This Ordinance  may   be  called  the   Andhra  Pradesh  Public 
Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation} (Amendment} 
Ordinance, 2022. 

 
 

(2) It shall be deemed to  have come into  force  on  the tst January 
2022. 

 
 

2.  In   the  Andhra  Pradesh  Public Employment (Regulation of  Age  of 
Superannuation) Act, 1984, (hereinafter referred to as the  Principal Act), 
in section 3,- 

(1) in  sub-section (1),for the  words"sixty yearS'   the  words"sixty two 
yearS' shall be substituted, 

(2) in sub section (2), for the words"sixty yearS', the  words"sixty two 
yearS' shall be substituted. 

(3) in sub section (3),- 
(a) for  the words"sixty yearS',  the  words ixty two yearS' shall be 

substituted. 
(b) in  Explanation-II, for  words"sixty yearS', the words"sixty two 

yearS' shall be substituted. 
(4) in sub section (4),- 

(a) in  clause (a), for  the  words"sixty yearS',  the  words"sixty two 
yearS' shall be substituted. 

(b) in clause (b), for  the  words"sixty yearS', the words"sixty two 
yearS' shall be substituted. 

3.  ln  the  Principal Act, in section 3A, in sub-section  (2),- 
(P.T.O) 



-2- 
 
 

(1)   for  the words "fifty eight  yearS',  the  words"sixty one  yearS' shall be 
substituted. 

 
 

(2)  for  the words"sixty yearS' wherever it occurs, the  words "sixty two 
yearS' shall be substituted 

 
 

2.  All  the  Departments of  the  Secretariathe Heads of  Departments and 
the District Collectors shall take  necessary action to implement the  provisions 
of the above Ordinance immediately. 

 
 

3.  This  order is  available in  online and  can  be  accessed at 
http://apegazette.cgg.gov.in . 

 
(BY ORDER AND IN THE  NAME OF THE GOVERNOR OF ANDHRA PRADESH) 

 
SHAMSHER SINGH RAWAT 

SPECIAL CHIEF SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
To 
All the Departments of Secretariat. 
All the  Heads of Departments. 
All the District Collectors. 
All District Treasury Officers. 

 
Copy  to: 
The Principal Accountant General (Audit),  A.P., Vijayawada. 
The  Principal Accountant General (A & E), A.P., Hyderabad. 
The  Director of Treasuries and Accounts, A.P., lbrahimpatnam. 
The Pay and Accounts Officer,  Ibrahimpatnam. 
The Law Department. 
The  Secretary, A.P. Legislature. 
The Principal Secretary to Governor, Raj Bhavan, Vijayawada. 
The  Principal Secretary to the  Chief  Minister, A.P., Velagapudi. 
The P.S  to Finance Minister, A.P., Velagapudi. 
The P.S  to Chief Secretary, A.P., Velagapudi. 
The  P.S  to Spl.C.S. (Finance Dept.). 
SFISC 

I IFORWARDED::BYORDERI I 

http://apegazette.cgg.gov.in

