Registered No. HSE-49. [Price : Rs.1-00 Paise

RIGHT TO
INFORMATION
l/

SolBHES T Bk

THE ANDHRAPRADESH GAZETTE
PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 1] AMARAVATI, MONDAY, 31 JANUARY, 2022.

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.,

The following is the authoritative text in English Language of the
Ordinance promulgated by the governor on the 30" January, 2022 is being
published under Article 348(3) of the Constitution of India for general
information:-

ANDHRA PRADESH ORDINANCE No. 1 OF 2022.

Promulgated by the Governor in the Seventy Third Year of the Republic
of India.

AN ORDINANCE FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION OF AGE OF
SUPERANNUATION) ACT, 1984.

Whereas, the age of superannuation of Government employees
has been prescribed as 55 years vide the Andhra Pradesh Public
Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984. For the
Last Grade Service employees, the age of superannuation has been
fixed as 60 years.

And whereas, the Principal Act has been further amended during
the year 2014 enhancing the age of superannuation from 58 years to
60 years to the State Government employees etc., w.e.f 02.06.2014

J.No.03/22 [1]



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART - IV-B

vide the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
Superannuation) (Amendment) Act, 2014 (Act No.4 of 2014);

And whereas, there has been significant improvement in the
average life expectancy compared to that in 2014. As per the world
Health Organization, the global average life expectancy in 2019
around 73 years and the average Indian lived up to 70 years. There
has been improved health conditions in general also;

And whereas, it is considered that in order to utilize the
experience and expertise of the senior employees and considering
the increased life expectancy and improved health conditions in
general, proposed to enhance the current age of superannuation of
60 years to 62 years to all the State Government employees covered
under the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
Superannuation) Act, 1984 and to give effect to the decision from
01.01.2022. In order to give effect to the above, it is necessaiy to
promulgate an ordinance.

And whereas, section 2 of the Ordinance seeks to give effect
to the above decision.

And whereas, section 3 of the Ordinance is necessitated as
consequence to the amendment of the Clause 3A(2) by the State of
Telangana in the 1984 Act (in application to Telangana) by Act No.3 of
2021 which came into force w.e.f. 30.03.2021.

And whereas, the subject matter needs immediate action in view
of the fact that if necessary amendments to the Statute are not
immediately affected, the tenure and the retirement dates of the serving
public servants would be affected. In view of the existing conditions
arising from the upsurge of covid in the immediate past, and the
legislature of the State is notin session, the above stated circumstances
require immediate action.

And whereas, the Legislature of the State is not now in session
and the Governor of the Andhra Pradesh is satisfied that
circumstances exist which render if necessary for him to take
immediate action.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by the Clause
(1) of Article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor hereby
promulgates the following Ordinance;-



31* JANUARY, 2022] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

1. (i) This Ordinance may be called the Andhra Pradesh Public Short title and
Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation) (Amendment) commencement.
Ordinance, 2022.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the
1st January 2022.

2. Inthe Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of Amendment of
Superannuation) Act, 1984, (hereinafter referred to as the principal Section 3.
. . Act 23 of 1984.

Act), in section 3,-

(1) insub-section (1), for the words “sixty years” the words “sixty
two years” shall be substituted,

(2) insub-section (2), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty
two years” shall be substituted.

(3) insub-section (3),-

(a) forthe words “sixty years”, the words “sixty two years”
shall be substituted.

(b) in Explanation-Il, for words “sixty years”, the words
“sixty two years” shall be substituted

(4) in sub-section(4),-

(a) inclause (a), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty
two years” shall be substituted.

(b) inclause (b), for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty
two years” shall be substituted.

3. Inthe Principal Act, in section 3A, in sub- section (2),- Amendment
of section 3A.

(1) for the words “fifty eight years”, the words “sixty one
years” shall be substituted.

(2) forthe words “sixty years” wherever it occurs, the words
“sixty two years” shall be substituted.

BISWA BHUSAN HARICHANDAN
Governor of Andhra Pradesh

VADDADI SUNITHA,
Secretary to Government (FAC),
Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.



Registered No. HSE/49.

RIGHT TO
? INFORMATION
7

SolB(HEE T Bk

THE ANDHRAPRADESH GAZETTE
PART -1VV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 1] AMARAVATI, MONDAY, 31 JANUARY, 2022.

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.,

GOPHBS Siasinen, oTREioe HOD
VDI DR,

2022, 558,308 EBS KSGH 8 TS & (Bod eTHBEd wofid
RS @B PSS B8 BodESEe Gg) 348(3) DT 8ok
0050 DY LD (HehBoSathdHB.

2022650 15 woREEE emegtdi
08 [Seroragd BF) St SoSHBins’ KEGHS &b Tedwlise.

wolF(HaE (Herseimre ($8d e Habiy Léa’a:aaééﬁea)
B30, 1984:% moESr $HBoHBS TS ES.

SolBIHES {E_ﬁ@éﬁsﬁ%me) (58D DB8Hoes S5 Lé&’nea%ééea) zﬁégéw,
1984 wrgoe (H408y e&ibe H8d DBk Sohkyyd 55 Soddyssmenre
DEPELBDE0LDHET KBk et {1t $Eid ailjbe Hid DB Hahryy
60 Bod&yssmenry ?Jgo»o{)éoéaeézém;

B> SolFHES [HeHE%E re (HEd DB BeHy) EHaiEsks)
(558e0) S5, 2014 (20146°Q 435 Segsso) wegoe 02-06-2014 Hod g
B30y &&%rhen Bnerd 068 HED Die HoHyH 58 VoBE)ssve
08 60 BosBSEreH DodhEr 20148 BosHBENS® [HrES HGKok
2088 $H5B0DS0LHSm;

[7]



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART - IV-B

Bolfomeaokn
SBSSD (@etogism.

86k, 20146° &5 208 sroins® DPYRSHD Kkt £98 wosnd®
BEPESEAS DIdB EoHETr, BBos ebiy $og Esedo 20198°
(5008 Biien £ o wwes) 73 DoBB)SHmenrrd $dak rEBcdh
Bisen B8 sodn 70 SodEBSnenrrd &5owhd HBAH Feeden b
H0REen DHRBOSHSER;

$00050, HIBE \%ﬁsegr‘{oe ©SoeyHH0 Hodafo JDesegl)
DIFrA0HE BT DB DOAS B o, HEHHRYS Jrredes
6B HOQB HOKESS I BHE D, wolBSaE Behe*E e (55D
Des BOHK) (_é&‘na:%ééea) 8335w, 1984 (Bl 5%) oo 040 t%ﬁséﬁ)e)oéa
(B0 H5D DB SAHH 60 JosEBEwe Hod 62 JoBEBvwH
ROBLBID &G B APaHEwzs 01-01-2022 Hod wiben Dk
(BOFB0BBBED BogE*NOBERIB. B (BOPEED ©HenHBHLH i &
TR ED BB ©BBETORR;

B, EEEILNS’ 25 HOFYSHN P VG eHeTosred
ﬁé%“@é&odﬁaém;
o —D
$oBc%, 30-03-2021 Hod wHensd S 20216° 3% Sixm

oyoe, Boorree Togo 1984 zﬁéego“aaaess (Boorrerd $805)) Poisn 3(2)D
BHBODS BUFHIPKOrT, EBILNE™ 3% 66513655‘333 S EET SorHIE;

SoBAko, WIS BT SdLeoen SGesd HY0HE"S Trdeyond, (HedE
&&%5He H8DsPe0 HBcHH GEK D Bben [HPABHHBCHT IR
cse)%eﬁs oD (PP DRSroFSND S Sy BioETHORdS
SSHEEDHD. KEDS adeo woos® EDE eBRysorr DY IS %Y BothEHy
@58 HoREHoDH 659)%}65 &0HER) BB ooy B0IH0Kd DErBE0s®
BH0MDEER, 29.BDDD B0RHeD Sgeo S B 50D @BBBBNK)0LHSe;

SBA%n, TG TPRRKOLD P BETBEE0S" TSothisisr HBA JoeoD
885 BHESORS H0Rben DGBIH GOPHEE HSGD ©PSCHHASLHH;
P58 BoDPEINE™ 2138 eISH oty (1) oo 2dKES
HTBBNOD DITPAKS, KIBGD BHpLd, RothSreorr & Bod erriEsnd
BB cS0TND: -
L (1) & orm@dsnd aoF@Bas ©Hehe*Eyre (H8d DBk Sabiy)
Babssen) (3550) erBds, 2022 ©d DEPWSB.

(2) =28, 2022 =358 15 & Hod wHeostdE Sy
PPROLREDNBD.



31* JANUARY, 2022] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 7

2. SoBHBE (:3’32;535556583?10@ (HBD DBHes HcH) [_éa’)aeaéééea) Bbosdo, 35 HOH)SSSS

1984 (90 88 sy HEed BE0D DEYH)ED 35 5663‘365:,‘.\1368,- Seites.
19846° 23
(1) ﬁ—:é—é’a@%&ﬁeﬁn (1)6° “eoB3 Hod&5men” @l BTV DT Liuy,

“©B3 Bo PoRE)Bimen” e HHLNODH GoSHBL.

(2) &a’:—éﬁéyﬁsﬁw (2)8° “eBR HoBL)Bnen” D HSEDeD BHenrr
“i3 Botd 26056%651303” @) HBHNOD SoBHBN.

(3) &é4563‘3t55333 (3)8°,-

(@) “@838 Hod&vHnen” o DRI aheorr “‘@blg Bow
JoHEBEmen” B Hes0O &ONDTD.

@) 2¥0E5n-TS" “@il JosEBsnen” wib HEEwes abeorr
“oi3 Both HoBE)BENe” B BHHVOD GoBBBD.

(4) %as-a’aa;—”bém (4)s5,-

@) 2o (D)° “wil Sodd)skne” ol Hiined otberr ‘@il
Boh HobEBsnen” el HiSxwod &oSBS.

@) 20w @) ‘@Bl SodBEnen” o Lo atheorr ‘@3
Boh JoHE)Bnen” ol HBBned SoSHSD.

3. B8 $ed 3D SOHSIE'D 6H-H0F S (2)6°,- 35 BBFyss0istd

(1) “CSmE 20D BoSE)EEees” 6> HisEnoD aiherr w8 ek

oSS BHInen” @b HIEneD &SI,

(2) “o83 Sod&BEnes” ek HEne 2tHerr © MHE SEHIr,
“@83 Both HoHeE)tnen” el HEEre GolSIB.

DIRHRS FBWLS,
SOlSHEE KSGE.

St S8,
b S (DBA)
0D, BPRS BFEBen KB
Fgehared, Tgehan.

Printed and Published by the Commissioner of Printing, Government of Andhra Pradesh, at A.P. Legislative
Assembly Press, Velagapudi, Amaravati.



